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Obituary
Frank Augustus Taylor was born in Arapahoe, NC on
September 18, 1931 to Queen Elizabeth Taylor and
George Boone. He moved to Newark, NJ where he
met and married his cherished wife, Lelia Edmond
Brown of Courtland, VA on February 13, 1954.

He served in the US Army from 1955 to 1958 and
received an honorable discharge as rank of PFC. After
his discharge from the Army, he held many jobs, and
eventually wound up at Reheis Laboratory in Berkeley
Heights, NJ where he was employed for over 30 years.
In the 1970s Frank became an independent
businessman, which resulted in him becoming the
proprietor of two neighborhood bars. His hobbies
included gardening, playing the guitar, and listening to
blues and jazz on the radio.

He is preceded in death by siblings Dorothy, George
Jr., Charles, Raymond and Nan; nephew Kevin, and
niece Sharon.

He leaves behind his wife, Lelia of 68 years, 3
daughters Deborah, Denise, Kim; and one son, Frank,
Jr.; siblings Buelah, Sudie, Shirley, Gorden Lee,
Wilbur and Lavern; niece Diane, nephew Jonathan,
and a host of cousins.
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Processional
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Prayer of Comfort
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(Two minutes each please)
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Interment
Evergreen Cemetery
Hillside, New Jersey



w
w
w
.h
o
n
o
r
y
o
u
.c
o
m

Professional Services Provided By

Acknowledgement
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